
Bid Tabulation
ITB 18009 (10 - 18)
AIR FILTERS 
Regina Johnson, Principal Buyer 
johnsonre@jccal.org

Big Group Name Item Number Size Quantity Per Year 
Cost Per 

Each
Quantity 
Per Case 

Cost Per 
Case

Extended Cost
Cost Per 

Each
Quantity 
Per Case 

Cost Per 
Case

Extended Cost 
Cost Per 

Each
Quantity 
Per Case

Cost Per 
Case

Extended Cost 

1 6 x 10 x 1 24  $   3.1832 12  $    38.1982  $                      76.3964  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.2800 12  $    15.3500  $                       30.7000 

2 6 x 14 x 1 12  $   3.4603 12  $    41.4036  $                      41.4036  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.2800 12  $    15.3500  $                       41.4036 

3 8 x 14 x 1 24  $   3.3634 12  $    40.3603  $                      80.7206  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.4700 12  $    17.6000  $                       35.2000 

4 9 x 9 x 1 144  $   3.1164 12  $    37.3968  $                    448.7616  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.2800 12  $    15.3500  $                     184.2000 

5 10 x 14 x 1 60  $   2.3520 12  $    28.2240  $                    141.1200  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.4700 12  $    17.6000  $                       88.0000 

6 10 x 16 x 1 12  $   2.9295 12  $    35.1540  $                      35.1540  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.6600 12  $    19.9700  $                       35.1540 

7 11 x 14 x 1 72  $   3.2928 12  $    39.5136  $                    237.0816  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.6600 12  $    19.9700  $                     119.8200 

8 11 x 17 x 1 6  $   3.6456 12  $    43.7472  $                      43.7472  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.6600 12  $    19.9700  $                       43.7472 

9 12 x 12 x 1 50  $   0.7350 12  $      8.8200  $                      44.1000  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.4500 12  $    17.3500  $                       86.7500 

10 12 x 14 x 1 24  $   3.3634 12  $    40.3603  $                      80.7206  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.6600 12  $    19.9700  $                       39.9400 

11 12 x 19 x 1 24  $   3.5135 12  $    42.1621  $                      84.3242  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.8100 12  $    21.7200  $                       43.4400 

12 12 x 20 x 1 12  $   0.9765 12  $    11.7180  $                      11.7180  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.8100 12  $    21.7200  $                       11.7180 

13 12 x 23 x 1 12  $   4.1013 12  $    49.2156  $                      49.2156  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.8100 12  $    21.7200  $                       49.2156 

14 12 x 29 x 1 12  $   4.2641 12  $    51.1686  $                      51.1686  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.9800 12  $    23.7100  $                       51.1686 

15 13 x 10 x 1 12  $   3.6456 12  $    43.7472  $                      43.7472  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.4700 12  $    17.6000  $                       43.7472 

16 13 x 14 x 1 72  $   3.2928 12  $    39.5136  $                    237.0816  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.4000 12  $    16.8500  $                     101.1000 

17 13 x 30 x 1 6  $   4.2641 12  $    51.1686  $                      51.1686  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.9800 12  $    23.7100  $                       51.1686 

18 14 x 14 x 1 24  $   2.4024 12  $    28.8288  $                      57.6576  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.4000 12  $    16.8500  $                       33.7000 

19 14 x 15 x 1 6  $   3.8084 12  $    45.7002  $                      45.7002  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.8100 12  $    21.7200  $                       45.7002 

20 14 x 20 x 1 6  $   0.8138 12  $      9.7650  $                        9.7650  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.0300 12  $    12.3600  $                         9.7650 

21 15 x 15 x 1 72  $   3.4398 12  $    41.2776  $                    247.6656  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.8100 12  $    21.7200  $                     130.3200 

22 15 x 17 x 1 72  $   3.7044 12  $    44.4528  $                    266.7168  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.7800 12  $    21.3400  $                     128.0400 

23 15 x 20 x 1 4  $   0.8138 12  $      9.7650  $                        9.7650  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.9800 12  $    23.7100  $                         9.7650 

24 16 x 17 x 1 24  $   3.7838 12  $    45.4054  $                      90.8108  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.8100 12  $    21.7200  $                       43.4400 

25 16 x 20 x 1 24  $   0.7733 12  $      9.2793  $                      18.5586  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.2100 12  $    14.4800  $                       28.9600 

26 16 x 25 x 1 12  $   0.8382 12  $    10.0580  $                      10.0580  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.0300 12  $    12.3600  $                       10.0580 

27 17 x 17 x 1 6  $   4.1013 12  $    49.2156  $                      49.2156  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.8100 12  $    21.7200  $                       49.2156 

28 18 x 14 x 1 12  $   3.6944 12  $    44.3331  $                      44.3331  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.8100 12  $    21.7200  $                       44.3331 

29 18 x 29 x 1 6  $   4.9151 12  $    58.9806  $                      58.9806  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     2.4800 12  $    29.7000  $                       58.9806 

30 19 x 19 x 1 6  $   4.2641 12  $    51.1686  $                      51.1686  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     2.0700 12  $    24.8400  $                       51.1686 

31 19 x 30 x 1 24  $   4.5345 12  $    54.4144  $                    108.8288  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     2.0600 12  $    24.7100  $                       49.4200 

32 20 x 20 x 1 4  $   0.8382 12  $    10.0580  $                      10.0580  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.2100 12  $    14.4800  $                       10.0580 

33 20 x 25 x 1 18  $   0.8382 12  $    10.0580  $                      20.1160  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.3200 12  $    15.8500  $                       31.7000 

34 20 x 30 x 1 18  $   1.3020 12  $    15.6240  $                      31.2480  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     2.1700 12  $    26.0800  $                       52.1600 

35 20 x 25 x 1 18  $   0.8382 12  $    10.0580  $                      20.1160  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.3200 12  $    15.8500  $                       31.7000 

36 20 x 30 x 1 18  $   1.3020 12  $    15.6240  $                      31.2480  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     2.1700 12  $    26.0800  $                       52.1600 
2,939.6397$                 -$                              1,927.1169$                  

FASTENAL FILTER BUY TRI-DIM FILTER

GROUP 1: 1" 
STANDARD 

FIBERGLASS 
FILTERS

GROUP 1 TOTAL: 1,205.9381$                                       -$                                                   712.8000$                                            

Grand Total  $                                                                                  92,740.22  $                                                                                  67,307.53  $                                                                                   109,580.34 
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Per Case 
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Each
Quantity 
Per Case 

Cost Per 
Case

Extended Cost 
Cost Per 
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Grand Total
37 12 X 16 X 1 24 3.8739$    12 46.4864$    92.9728$                       4.1500$    12 49.8000$    99.6000$                        3.6500$      48 51.6500$    51.6500$                        

38 12 X 20 X 1 6  $   3.5480 12 42.5754$    42.5754$                        $   2.2000 12 26.4000$    42.5754$                         $     2.1300 48 50.1300$    50.1300$                        

39 12 X 24 X 1 6  $   2.8365 12 34.0380$    34.0380$                        $   2.3100 12 27.6000$    34.0380$                         $     2.1300 48 50.1300$    50.1300$                        

40 14 X 30 X 1 6  $   7.6004 12 91.2051$    91.2051$                        $   4.6700 12 56.0400$    91.2051$                         $     7.6300 24 31.6300$    31.6300$                        

41 16 X 16 X 1 48  $   2.9315 12 35.1780$    140.71$                          $   2.6500 12 31.8000$    127.20$                           $     2.4400 24 26.4400$    52.8800$                        

42 16 X 20 X 1 186  $   2.0769 12 24.9228$    398.7648$                      $   2.3000 12 27.6000$    441.6000$                       $     2.2500 24 26.2500$    210.0000$                      

43 16 X 24 X 1 22  $   3.5756 12 42.9073$    85.8146$                        $   2.8700 12 34.4400$    68.8800$                         $     2.5500 24 26.5500$    26.5500$                        

44 16 X 25 X 1 636  $   2.3091 12 27.7092$    1,468.5876$                   $   2.6000 12 31.2000$    1,653.6000$                    $     2.4100 24 26.4100$    713.0700$                      

45 16 X 30 X 1 36  $   4.3329 12 51.9948$    105.5340$                      $   5.7100 12 68.5200$    95.4000$                         $     3.0300 24 27.0300$    54.0600$                        

46 20 X 20 X 1 158  $   3.2256 12 38.7066$    541.8924$                      $   2.5400 12 30.4800$    426.7200$                       $     2.4100 24 26.4100$    184.8700$                      

47 20 X 21.5 X 1 6  $   9.6836 12 116.2035$  116.2035$                      $   5.7100 12 68.5200$    116.2035$                       $     4.2300 24 28.2300$    28.2300$                        

48 20 X 24 X 1 6  $   4.2641 12 51.1686$    51.1686$                        $   2.8000 12 33.6000$    51.1686$                         $     2.7800 24 26.7800$    26.7800$                        

49 20 X 25 X 1 470  $   2.6187 12 31.4244$    1,256.9760$                   $   2.8500 12 34.2000$    1,368.0000$                    $     2.6200 24 26.6200$    532.4000$                      

50 20 X 30 X 1 26  $   4.4921 12 53.9046$    116.1198$                      $   3.5400 12 42.4800$    91.4400$                         $     3.2700 24 27.2700$    54.5400$                        

51 24 X 24 X 1 116  $   3.3460 12 40.1520$    401.5200$                      $   3.0700 12 36.8400$    368.4000$                       $     2.8300 24 26.8300$    134.1500$                      

52 25 X 25 X 1 104  $   4.3260 12 51.9120$    467.2080$                      $   3.5200 12 42.2400$    380.1600$                       $     3.1200 24 27.1200$    135.6000$                      
5,411.2926$                 5,456.1906$                  2,336.6700$                  
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53 12 x 24 x 2 84  $   1.0290 12  $    12.3480  $                      86.4360  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.4600 12  $    17.4700  $                     122.2900 

54 16 x 16 x 2 84 1.0290$    12  $    12.3480  $                      86.4360  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID  1.7400$      12  $    20.8400  $                     145.8800 

55 16 x 20 x 2 84  $   0.9085 12  $    10.9015  $                      76.3105  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.4600 12  $    17.4700  $                     122.2900 

56 20 x 20 x 2 84  $   1.0599 12  $    12.7184  $                      89.0288  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.7100 12  $    20.4700  $                     143.2900 

57 20 x 24 x 2 84  $   1.7670 12  $    14.1201  $                      98.8407  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.6400 12  $    19.7200  $                     138.0400 

58 20 x 25 x 2 84  $   1.0599 12  $    12.7184  $                      89.0288  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.5900 12  $    19.0900  $                     133.6300 

59 24 x 24 x 2 84  $   1.2113 12  $    14.5354  $                    101.7478  NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   NO BID   $     1.6800 12  $    20.2200  $                     141.5400 
627.8286$                    -$                              946.9600$                     GROUP 3 TOTAL: 89.6898$                                            

GROUP 3: 2" 
STANDARD 

FIBERGLASS 
FILTERS

GROUP 2 TOTAL: 780.4887$                                          641.7600$                                          505.4800$                                            

GROUP 2: 1" 
PLEATED 
FILTERS

-$                                                   135.2800$                                            

FILTER BUYFASTENAL

TRI-DIM FILTERFILTER BUYFASTENAL

TRI-DIM FILTER
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60 12 X 24 X 2 1,012 2.5800$    12 30.9600$    2,631.6000$                  2.8000$    12 33.6000$    2,856.0000$                   2.6700$      24 64.0800$    2,755.4400$                   

61 16 X 16 X 2 24 3.5750$    12 42.9000$    85.8000$                       3.4700$    12 41.6400$    83.2800$                        2.8300$      12 33.9600$    67.9200$                        

62 16 X 20 X 2 475 2.5026$    12 30.0312$    1,201.2480$                  2.7200$    12 32.6400$    1,305.6000$                   2.9000$      12 34.8000$    1,392.0000$                   

63 16 X 24 X 2 300 3.5488$    12 42.5855$    1,064.6375$                  3.2500$    12 39.0000$    975.0000$                      3.0800$      12 36.9600$    924.0000$                      

64 16 X 25 X 2 554 2.8767$    12 34.5204$    1,622.4588$                  3.1200$    12 37.4400$    1,759.6800$                   3.1400$      12 37.6800$    1,770.9600$                   

65 20 X 20 X 2 200 2.8767$    12 34.5204$    586.8468$                     3.1300$    12 37.5600$    638.5200$                      2.9000$      12 34.8000$    591.6000$                      

66 20 X 24 X 2 244 3.5346$    12 42.4152$    890.7192$                     3.5300$    12 42.3600$    889.5600$                      3.4800$      12 41.7600$    876.9600$                      

67 20 X 25 X 2 408 3.3411$    12 40.0932$    1,363.1688$                  3.4700$    12 41.6400$    1,415.7600$                   3.5400$      12 42.4800$    1,444.3200$                   

68 24 X 24 X 2 2,580 3.8055$    12 45.6660$    9,818.1900$                  3.8700$    12 46.4400$    9,984.6000$                   3.9500$      12 47.4000$    10,191.0000$                 

69 24 X 36 X2 36 22.6126$  12 271.3511$  814.0533$                     14.0100$  12 168.1200$  504.3600$                      13.1900$    12 158.2800$  474.8400$                      

70 28.5 X 29.5 6 36.7652$  12 441.1827$  441.1827$                     14.0100$  12 168.1200$  441.1827$                      22.6400$    12 271.6800$  441.1827$                      
20,519.9051$               20,853.5427$                20,930.2227$                

Big Group Name Item Number Size Quantity Per Year 
Cost Per 

Each
Quantity 
Per Case 

Cost Per 
Case

Extended Cost 
Cost Per 

Each
Quantity 
Per Case 

Cost Per 
Case
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Each
Quantity 
Per Case 

Cost Per 
Case

Extended Cost 

Grand Total
71 12 X 24 X 2 40 2.8600$    12 34.3200$    137.2800$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 4.1800$      12 50.1600$    200.6400$                      

72 16 X 20 X 4 24 5.4769$    6 32.8614$    131.4456$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 4.3500$      6 26.1000$    104.4000$                      

73 20 X 24 X 4 24 6.8640$    6 41.1840$    164.7360$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5.2200$      6 31.3200$    125.2800$                      

74 24 X 24 X 4 80 7.0000$    6 42.0000$    588.0000$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5.6900$      6 34.1400$    477.9600$                      

75 25 X 29 X 4 8 11.8645$  6 71.1869$    142.3738$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 6.9700$      6 41.8200$    83.6400$                        
1,163.8354$                 -$                              991.9200$                     

Big Group Name Item Number Size Quantity Per Year 
Cost Per 

Each
Quantity 
Per Case 

Cost Per 
Case

Extended Cost 
Cost Per 

Each
Quantity 
Per Case 

Cost Per 
Case

Extended Cost 
Cost Per 

Each
Quantity 
Per Case 

Cost Per 
Case

Extended Cost 

Grand Total

76
20 x 24 x 18, 65% 

Efficiency
140

32.3400$  4 129.3600$  4,527.6000$                  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 12.5100$    5 62.5500$    
1,751.4000$                   

77
24 x 24 x 18, 65% 

Efficiency
280

18.9630$  4 75.8520$    5,309.6400$                  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 14.1500$    5 70.7500$    
3,962.0000$                   

78
12 x 24 x 22, 85% - 

90%  Efficiency
474

11.7906$  4 47.1624$    5,612.3256$                  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 9.4300$      8 75.4400$    
4,526.4000$                   

79
20 x 20 x 22, 85% - 

90%  Efficiency
39

28.6787$  4 114.7146$  1,147.1460$                  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 13.7000$    5 68.5000$    
548.0000$                      

80
20 x 24 x 22, 85% - 

90%  Efficiency
12

29.4770$  4 117.9080$  353.7240$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 13.6700$    5 68.3500$    
205.0500$                      

81
24 x 12 x 22, 85% - 

90%  Efficiency
8

11.7906$  4 47.1624$    94.3248$                       NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 16.7800$    8 134.2400$  
134.2400$                      

82
24 x 24 x 22, 85% - 

90%  Efficiency
1,281

19.3113$  4 77.2452$    24,795.7092$                NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 15.5100$    5 77.5500$    
19,930.3500$                 

83
12 x 24 x 30, 85% - 

90%  Efficiency
80

14.3780$  4 57.5120$    1,150.2400$                  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 10.4800$    8 83.8400$    
838.4000$                      

84
24 x 24 x 30, 85% - 

90%  Efficiency
112

23.7580$  4 95.0320$    2,660.8960$                  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 17.4200$    4 69.6800$    1,951.0400$                   
45,651.6056$               -$                              33,846.8800$                

GROUP 4 TOTAL: 1,056.2257$                                       688.5600$                                          803.8800$                                            

710.9000$                                            

GROUP 5: 4" 
PLEATED 
FILTERS

GROUP 5 TOTAL: 221.5523$                                          -$                                                   183.5400$                                            

761.9486$                                          -$                                                   

GROUP 4: 2" 
PLEATED 
FILTERS

GROUP 6: BAG 
FILTERS

GROUP 6 TOTAL:

TRI-DIM FILTERFILTER BUYFASTENAL

FASTENAL FILTER BUY TRI-DIM FILTER

FASTENAL FILTER BUY TRI-DIM FILTER



Big Group Name Item Number Size Quantity Per Year 
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Per Case 

Cost Per 
Case
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Cost Per 

Each
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Cost Per 
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Grand Total
12 x 24 x 2, 95% 

Cartridge
 (With Header), 12” 

Depth AE Cores
24 x 24 x 2, 95% 

Cartridge
 (With Header), 12” 

Depth AE Cores
12 x 24 x 2, 95% 

Cartridge 
(No Header), 12” 

Depth AE Cores
24 x 24 x 2, 95% 

Cartridge
(No Header), 12” 

Depth AE Cores
16,426.1120$               40,997.8000$                45,190.8000$                

37.6800$    

46.7400$    

2

1

2

1NO BID

80.6960$    

42.2700$  

67.7800$    

47.0000$    

63.1000$    

42.2700$    

2

1

2

1NO BID

2

NO BID

78.2400$    

FASTENAL FILTER BUY TRI-DIM FILTER

NO BID

3,524.5600$                   

10,152.0000$                 

5,679.0000$                   

1

NO BID

33.8900$  

47.0000$  

31.5500$  

40.3480$  

 $ 56.6181 

NO BID

 $    56.6181 

NO BID

248.5300$                                            

88 512

GROUP 7: 
CARTRIDGES

GROUP 7 TOTAL: 137.3141$                                          220.1500$                                          

85 104

86 216

87 180

4,196.1920$                  

12,229.9200$                

NO BID

48.1900$    

75.3600$    

46.7400$    

39.1200$    

48.1900$    

23,930.8800$                 21,642.2400$                 

4,068.4800$                   

10,409.0400$                 

6,782.4000$                   



Big Group Name Item Number Size Quantity Per Year 
Cost Per 

Each
Quantity 
Per Case 

Cost Per 
Case

Extended Cost 
Cost Per 

Each
Quantity 
Per Case 

Cost Per 
Case

Extended Cost 
Cost Per 

Each
Quantity 
Per Case 

Cost Per 
Case

Extended Cost 

Grand Total

89
24 Inch Roll Type 

Fiberglass
2  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

79.0400$    1 79.0400$    
 $                     158.0800 

90
33 Inch Roll Type 

Fiberglass
3  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

80.0600$    1 80.0600$    
 $                     240.1800 

91
36 Inch Roll Type 

Fiberglass
2  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

96.9900$    1 96.9900$    
 $                     193.9800 

92
44 Inch Roll Type 

Fiberglass
3  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

98.5900$    1 98.5900$    
 $                     295.7700 

93
45 Inch Roll Type 

Fiberglass
16  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

103.0700$  1 103.0700$  
 $                  1,649.1200 

94
48 Inch Roll Type 

Fiberglass
6  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

106.4200$  1 106.4200$  
 $                     638.5200 

95
57 Inch Roll Type 

Fiberglass
2  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

117.0600$  1 117.0600$  
 $                     234.1200 

3,409.7700$                  

Tri-Dim Filter 

Corporation
FilterBuy 
Fastenal Company 2821 5th Ave. South, Birmingham, AL 35233 | Charles Miller   P: 205.328.8684  E: narfp@fastenal.com 

Contact Information

93 Industrial Drive, Louisa, VA 23093 | Mark King   P: 540.967.5431  E: m.king@trimdim.com

PACA Page

101 Pope Street, Talledega, AL 35160 | Griselda Taylor   P: 256.375.8945  E: griselda.taylor@filterbuy.com

Statement of Compliance with Alabama Code 31-13-9
Signature Sheet
Price Sheet

Addendum 1
Addendum 2
Bid Bond/Cashiers Check 

YES
YES
YES
YES

YES
NO

NO
NO

YES
YES

Non-Collusion Affidavit

YES
YES
YES
YES

YES

YES
YES
YES
YES
YES
YES
YES
YES
YES

YES
YES
YES
YES
YES

NO

Required Forms 
YES
YES
YES

Delivery is guranteed not later than _____ days after order date 1-3 1-7 11

GROUP 8: AIR 
FILTER ROLL 

TYPE 
FIBERGLASS/ 

WIDTH

GROUP 8 TOTAL: 681.2300$                                            

Notification of Intent to Award
Equal Opportunity Certification Form
Affidavit of Contractor

Guranteed maximum discount available is contract is renewed for 2nd year 
Guranteed maximum discount available is contract is renewed for 3rd year 

40-70%
40-70%

0% 0%
0% 0%

Maximum Discount

FILTER BUYFASTENAL TRI-DIM FILTER


